National Procurement NHS National Services Scotland N H S

Gyle Square,
NHSScotland Assure 1 South Gyle Crescent Sugem., s’
R .. . EDINBURGH, National
Specialist Healthcare Commissioning EH12 9EB TR
Telephone 0131 275 6000 Scotland

Date: 23 October 2024
Our ref: K: FOI/Ref: 2024-000335
Email: nss.devservicesfoi@nhs.scot

Freedom of Information Reference: FOI-2024-000335 — Veolia Contract.
| refer to your freedom of information request that we received on 25 September 2024.
| am writing to request the following information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000.

1. A copy of the current contract between NHS Scotland, or any of its bodies, and Veolia, or
any of its subsidiaries.

2. Details of any amendments, extensions, or revisions made to the contract since its
inception.

3. Any related performance reports or assessments carried out by NHS Scotland in relation to
Veolia's services under this contract, including key performance indicators (KPIs) and their
results.

We have now completed the search of our records and can provide you with the following information:

1. A copy of the current contract between NHS Scotland, or any of its bodies, and Veolia, or
any of its subsidiaries.

Please find attached Appendix 1 — Veolia Contract_Redacted and Appendix 2 - Terms and Conditions
— Services. This is the contract and terms between Veolia and NHS National Services Scotland (NSS)
for the Framework NP803/24 Recyclates and General Waste management. The documentation being
released includes personal data of third parties, specifically, signatures, names of individuals which
have not been released into the public domain regarding this topic or non-senior members of staff.
Where this is the case, these names and contact details have been redacted in line with exception
Section 38 ((1)(b)) of the Freedom of Information Scotland Act, 2002 (FOISA) — Personal information.

2. Details of any amendments, extensions, or revisions made to the contract since its
inception.

Under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information Scotland Act, 2002 (FOISA) an organisation does not
have to provide that information if it does not hold it. NSS does not hold this information as this
framework went live on 1st April 2024 and no amendments, extensions or revisions have yet been
made.
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3. Any related performance reports or assessments carried out by NHS Scotland in relation to
Veolia's services under this contract, including key performance indicators (KPls) and their
results.

Under Section 17 of FOISA an organisation does not have to provide that information if it does not
hold it. Veolia have not been appointed under call off by any of the Health Boards that utilise the
framework and as such we would not carry out any performance reports or assessments.

I trust you will find the information of assistance and if you require any further information, please do
not hesitate to contact me.

If you are unhappy with any aspect of how we have dealt with your request, you can make
representations to us asking us to review the handling of your request. Please write to the Associate
Director Governance and Board Services (Board Secretary) at the email address nss.foi@nhs.scot
within 40 working days of the date of this correspondence.

If after a review you are still unhappy, you also have the right to apply to the Scottish Information
Commissioner, who can be contacted at Kinburn Castle, St Andrews, Fife, KY16 9DS, or via their
online application form.

If you have any queries about this letter, please contact me at the above address.

Yours sincerely,
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m disability Chief Executive Mary Morgan
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